
29 Cheviot Drive, Dibden
£265,000



29 Cheviot Drive
Dibden, Southampton

Positioned in central Dibden, this charming 2-
bedroom mid-terraced property boasts a range of
features ideal for first-time buyers or small families.
The interior showcases a stylishly refitted kitchen,
offering a contemporary space for culinary
endeavours, while the double glazing and gas-fired
central heating ensure comfort and energy
efficiency throughout. With a garage located
conveniently in a block, along with an allocated
parking space, practicality meets convenience
seamlessly. The property’s two double bedrooms
provide ample accommodation, making it an
inviting and functional living space. A low-
maintenance rear garden adds to the appeal,
featuring a lawn, slabbed patio area, and a pathway
leading to a rear gate that opens to the alleyway,
along with a timber shed for additional storage.
Outdoor enjoyment is further enhanced by the
presence of an outside tap and sockets, catering to
a variety of needs.


Cheviot Drive is located in the residential area of
Dibden, perfect for growing families and those
seeking their first home. The road offers easy access
to amenities such as supermarkets, schools, and
parks. It is well-connected to the rest of the town
and has good transport links, making it convenient
for daily commutes.
Council Tax band: B

Tenure: Freehold






