
FORMER CHERRY TREE HOTEL AND LAND ADJACENT, PREES HEATH, SHROPSHIRE, SY13 2AF

FOR SALE - DEVELOPMENT OPPORTUNITY WITH A SIGNIFICANT ROAD FRONTAGE

https://www.hallsgb.com/commercial/
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LOCATION
The property is prominently located fronting onto the 

A41 (dual carriageway) on the southbound section of 

the road.

The property is located in Prees Heath with other 

surrounding occupiers including The Raven and Aston 

Barclay car auctions.

The A41 Serves as a main arterial route between the 

towns of Whitchurch and Shrewsbury and  Market 

Drayton. The property is located close to the 

intersection of the A49 and A41 Trunk Roads.

The property is located approximately 3 miles south of 

the town of Whitchurch and approximately 20 miles 

north of the county town of Shrewsbury and within 

proximity of all local amenities.
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DESCRIPTION
The property comprises of a very prominently located 

site with a significant road frontage onto the A41. The 

site is accessed from the southbound road off the A41 

(dual carriageway). The property comprises of the 

former Cherry Tree Hotel which is dilapidated.

The property would lend itself to a variety of 

commercial and residential use subject to statutory 

consents. The site offers an ideal redevelopment site 

with significant traffic movement on the A41 and it 

being located close to the junction of the A41 and A49.

An inspection of the Former Cherry Tree Hotel can be 

organised however it should be appreciated that the 

property is dilapidated and requires a comprehensive  

scheme of refurbishment.

The property is held under the ownership of Title 

Number SL55752.

A viewing of the property to appreciate its potential is 

recommended.

ACCOMMODATION
All measurements are approximate

ACRES HECTARES

TOTAL SITE AREA 2 0.81



VIEWING
Strictly by prior arrangement with the selling agents. 

For more information or to arrange a viewing, please 

contact : 

Commercial Department

TENURE
The property is understood to be of freehold tenure held 

under the ownership of Title Number SL55752.

PLANNING
Interested parties should make their own enquiries.

The property would lend itself to a variety of commercial 

and residential use (subject to statutory consents.  The 

property benefits from significant road frontage that 

allows it to be developed for a variety of roadside uses.

SERVICES
Prospective purchasers are to rely on their own enquiries.

It is understood that all mains services are available.

PRICE
Offers in the region of £500,000 (Exclusive)

LEGAL COSTS
Each party is to be responsible for their own legal costs 

associated with the transaction.

VAT
The property is understood to be elected for VAT. 

Therefore VAT will  be charged on the sale price.

RATES AND EPC
RATEABLE VALUE RATES PAYABLE ENERGY RATING

TBC TBC TBC

LOCAL  AUTHORITY
Shropshire Council, Shirehall, Abbey Foregate, 

Shrewsbury, SY2 6ND    

SHROPSHIRE COUNCIL WEBSITE

0345 678 9000

IMPORTANT NOTICE Halls have advised their clients on the Code of Practice for Commercial Leases in 
England and Wales. Halls, for themselves and for the vendor of this property, or as the case may be, lessor 
whose agent they are, given notice that: i) These particulars are intended for guidance only. They are 
prepared and issued in good faith and are intended to give a fair description but do not constitute part of an 
over  or contract. Any information given should not be relied on as a statement or representation of fact or 
that the property or its services are in good condition. ii) Halls have not made any investigations into the 
existence or otherwise  IMPORTANT NOTICE Halls have advised their clients on the Code of Practice for 
Commercial Leases in England and Wales. Halls, for themselves and for the vendor of this property, or as the 
case may be, lessor whose agent they are, given notice that: i) These particulars are intended for guidance 
only. They are prepared and issued in good faith and are intended to give a fair description but do not 
constitute part of an over  or contract. Any information given should not be relied on as a statement or 
representation of fact or that the property or its services are in good condition. ii) Halls have not made any 
investigations into the existence or otherwise of any issues concerning pollution and potential land, air and 
water contamination. The purchaser is responsible for making his or her own enquiries in this regard. iii) 
Neither Halls nor any of their employees has any authority to make or give any representation or warranty 
whatsoever in relation to the property. iv) The images show only certain parts and aspects of the property at 
the time they were taken/created. Any areas, measurements or distances given are approximate only. Any 
plans are for identification purposes only. v) Any reference to alterations to, or use of, any part of the property 
is not a statement that any necessary planning, building regulations or other consent has been obtained. An 
intending purchaser must verify these matters. An occupier should not rely upon the Use stated in these 
particulars and should check their proposed use with the relevant Planning Authority .
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