
Oakridge Close
Winscombe

Fixed Price 
£650,000



10 Oakridge Close
Winscombe, Winscombe

A fantastic opportunity to purchase this incredible
three bedroom detached bungalow set in a
generous plot located in Sidcot. Upon entering the
property you are greeted with a lovely porch area
which opens into a lovely welcoming entrance
hallway. This really gives the essence of space. The
property offers the living accommodation to the
west wing and the bedrooms to the east wing. The
living area comprises of an incredibly spacious and
well designed living room. This offers a bay window
allowing for the rear garden aspect to be
highlighted in a beautiful way. Leading from this
room you can enter the separate dining room which
also benefits from the rear facing view. A really good
space for a large dining room table. With the
potential to be opened up into the kitchen area
which would create an impressive open plan
kitchen/dining area. The current kitchen is a good
size with ample amounts of worktop and unit space.
Leading from the kitchen is a utility room which
provides great space for washer/dryer. Also homing
one of the WCs. Completing the living half of the
property is another WC with shower.

Detached Bungalow
Offered With No Onward Chain
Generous Plot
Parking For Four+ Cars



10 Oakridge Close
Winscombe, Winscombe

The bedrooms are all double rooms. Bedroom one
provides rear garden views and storage space.
Bedroom two and three are double rooms with
space for free standing furniture. Following suit with
the rest of the property the family bathroom is also
a fantastic size with bath, sink and toilet alongside
the towel radiator completing this room.

Detached Bungalow
Offered With No Onward Chain
Generous Plot
Parking For Four+ Cars
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