
Salters Road, Gosforth, NE3 4XJ



**AVAILABLE NOVEMBER 2020**
**FURNISHED** **VIDEO TOUR
AVAILABLE** A smart and stylish lower
Tyneside style flat located on Salters Road in
Gosforth. Well presented throughout and in
a great location close to transport links, this
property is ideal for either a professional
couple or sharers alike.

The property briefly comprises an entrance
hall with spacious storage cupboard, a
double bedroom to the front with bay
window and a walk-in style wardrobe space.
There is a second double bedroom to the
rear, a separate study, spacious well
furnished lounge, a modern fitted kitchen
with appliances and a plush family bathroom
WC. Externally there is a private yard to the
rear and on street parking to the front. Fully
furnished throughout, with gas central
heating and double glazed windows.

Available 18th November 2020 | £650pcm
| Lower Tyneside Flat | 662 Sq. ft (61.5
m2) | Two Double Bedrooms | Lounge |
Modern Kitchen | Family Bathroom WC |
Study | Rear Yard | Excellent Location |
Furnished | On Street Parking | Close To
Transport Links | DG & GCH | EPC
Rating: D

£650 PCM


