
Belle Grove Terrace, Spital Tongues, NE2 4LL



**AVAILABLE IMMEDIATELY**
**FURNISHED** With Open Aspect Views
Over Fields and access via its own Private
Entrance Point! This lower ground floor
conversion apartment is ideally located on
Belle Grove Terrace, Spital Tongues. The
apartment, close to Newcastle University
and Newcastle's RVI Hospital and is also
perfectly placed to give access to the
surrounding greenery as well as Newcastle
City Centre itself.

Available on a furnished basis, the
accommodation briefly comprises: private
entrance porch through to; a 22ft lounge
with alcove storage, open to; kitchen diner,
with fitted wall and base units together with
work surfaces, spot lighting and tiled floor.
Two bedrooms, one with built in wardrobe;
bathroom with three piece suite. Rear
hallway with both storage and utility
cupboards. Externally, to the front a
communal garden, laid mainly to lawn with
iron railings. To the rear, the yard provides
one allocated parking space dedicated to the
apartment, residents permit parking at the
front of the terrace, providing owner and
visitor permits. With gas central heating and
private front door, Victorian conversion
demands an early internal inspection!

Available Immediately | £850pcm |
Furnished | Victorian Conversion
Apartment | 902 Sq ft (83.8m2) | Lower
Ground Floor | Two Bedrooms | Private
Entrance | 22ft Lounge open to Kitchen

£850 PCM

Diner | Bathroom | Open Aspect Views |
Excellent Location | GCH | Allocated &
Permit Parking with Resident & Visitor
Permits | EPC Rating: C


