
Belle Grove Terrace, Spital Tongues, NE2 4LL



**AVAILABLE IMMEDIATELY**
**FURNISHED**A fantastic basement
conversion apartment, ideally located on
Belle Grove Terrace, Spital Tongues. The
apartment, close to Newcastle University
and Newcastle's RVI Hospital is also
perfectly placed to give access to the
surrounding greenery as well as Newcastle
City Centre itself.

The accommodation briefly comprises:
Private entrance through to; open plan living
area with tiled floor and open to kitchen
with fitted wall and base units with work
surfaces and spot lighting; rear hallway
providing access to two double bedrooms
and the shower room, complete with three
piece suite. With electric heating and private
front door, this Victorian conversion
demands an early internal inspection!

Available Immediately | £650pcm |
Furnished | Victorian Conversion
Apartment | 551 Sq ft (51.1m2) | Basement
Floor | Two Double Bedrooms | Private
Entrance | Open Plan Living Area &
Kitchen | Shower Room | Excellent
Location | EPC Rating: D

£650 PCM


